

BID ANALYSIS **TOWN OF WESTERLY/WESTERLY PUBLIC SCHOOLS**
DUMPSTER/TRASH RECYCLING SERVICES

Bid Number: 2021-009
 Prepared by M. Bednarski
 DATE: 4/7/2021

TOWN LOCATION/ADDRESS	DURATION	Number of Pick-up per Week	Number of Dumpsters (Trash)	Number of Dumpsters (Recycle)	SIZE OF DUMPSTER (Trash)	SIZE OF DUMPSTER (Recycle)	WASTE MANAGEMENT				CWPM				E-Z WASTE											
							Year 1 7/1/2021 to 7/1/2022	TYPE	Year 2 7/1/2022 to 7/1/2023	TYPE	Year 3 7/1/2023 to 7/1/2024	TYPE	Year 1 7/1/2021 to 7/1/2022	TYPE	Year 2 7/1/2022 to 7/1/2023	TYPE	Year 3 7/1/2023 to 7/1/2024	TYPE	Year 1 7/1/2021 to 7/1/2022	TYPE	Year 2 7/1/2022 to 7/1/2023	TYPE	Year 3 7/1/2023 to 7/1/2024	TYPE		
316 Atlantic Ave. New Town			1	1	8 yard	8 yard	\$3,006.19	8Yd Trash	\$3,156.52	8Yd Trash	\$3,314.36	8Yd Trash	\$3,530.00	8Yd Trash	\$3,635.00	8Yd Trash	\$3,745.00	8Yd Trash	\$3,769.00	8Yd Trash	\$3,769.00	8Yd Trash	\$3,957.00	8Yd Trash		
	April 1- May 20	1					\$536.11	8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		
	May 20 - June 30	2					459.52	\$172.15		\$180.76		\$189.80		\$2,200.00		\$2,265.00		\$2,335.00		\$1,368.00		\$1,368.00		\$1,436.00		
	July 1- Sept. 12	3					843.46																			
	Sept 13- Oct 17	1					306.35																			
	18-Oct	REMOVE					\$2,145.44																			
Must be picked up prior to 8:00 AM TRASH AND APPROPRIATE RECYCLING and include ONE MANDATORY WEEKEND PICKUP																										
365 Atlantic Avenue Old Town			1	1	12 yard	8 yard	\$3,006.19	10Yd Trash	\$3,156.52	10Yd Trash	\$3,314.36	10Yd Trash	\$4,412.50	10Yd Trash	\$4,543.75	10Yd Trash	\$4,681.25	10Yd Trash	\$5,593.00	10Yd Trash	\$5,593.00	10Yd Trash	\$5,873.00	10Yd Trash		
	April 1- May 20	1					\$536.11	8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		8Yd recycle		
	May 20 - June 30	2					\$459.52	\$172.15		\$180.76		\$189.80		\$2,200.00		\$2,265.00		\$2,335.00		\$1,368.00		\$1,368.00		\$1,436.00		
	July 1- Sept. 12	3					\$843.46																			
	Sept 13- Oct 17	1					\$306.35																			
	18-Oct	REMOVE					\$2,145.44																			
Must be picked up prior to 8:00 AM TRASH AND APPROPRIATE RECYCLING and include ONE MANDATORY WEEKEND PICKUP																										
NOTE: All Parks/Fields have the same schedule																										
Cimolore Field	March 1- Nov 30th	1x week	1	1	8 yard	8 yard	\$331.62	8Yd Trash	\$348.21	8Yd Trash	\$365.62	8Yd Trash	\$2,500.00	8Yd Trash	\$2,600.00	8Yd Trash	\$2,700.00	8Yd Trash	\$2,617.00	8Yd Trash	\$2,617.00	8Yd Trash	\$2,748.00	8Yd Trash		
99 Wilson Street Westerly, RI 02891	Dec. 1- Feb. 28th	1x month					\$172.15	8Yd recycle	\$180.76	8Yd recycle	\$189.80	8Yd recycle	\$1,550.00	8Yd recyc	\$1,650.00	8Yd recyc	\$1,750.00	8Yd recycle	\$936.00	8Yd recyc	\$936.00	8Yd recyc	\$983.00	8Yd recycle		
Craig Field	March 1- Nov 30th	1x week	1	1	4 yard	4 yard	\$197.92	4Yd Trash	\$207.82	4Yd Trash	\$218.22	4Yd Trash	\$1,250.00	4Yd Trash	\$1,300.00	4Yd Trash	\$1,350.00	4Yd Trash	\$1,369.00	4Yd Trash	\$1,369.00	4Yd Trash	\$1,437.00	4Yd Trash		
10 Mountain Avenue, Westerly, RI 02891	Dec. 1- Feb. 28th	1x month					\$127.45	4Yd recycle	\$133.83	4Yd recycle	\$140.53	4Yd recycle	\$780.00	4Yd recyc	\$810.00	4Yd recyc	\$840.00	4Yd recycle	\$468.00	4Yd recyc	\$468.00	4Yd recyc	\$491.00	4Yd recycle		
Rotary Park	March 1- Nov 30th	1x week	1	1	6 yard	6 yard	\$270.17	6Yd Trash	\$283.68	6Yd Trash	\$297.87	6Yd Trash	\$1,870.00	6Yd Trash	\$1,950.00	6Yd Trash	\$2,030.00	6Yd Trash	\$1,993.00	6Yd Trash	\$1,993.00	6Yd Trash	\$2,093.00	6Yd Trash		
138 Airport Road Westerly, RI 02891	Dec. 1- Feb. 28th	1x month					\$155.20	6Yd recycle	\$162.96	6Yd recycle	\$171.11	6Yd recycle	\$1,170.00	6Yd recyc	\$1,220.00	6Yd recyc	\$1,270.00	6Yd recycle	\$702.00	6Yd recyc	\$702.00	6Yd recyc	\$737.00	6Yd recycle		
Gingerella Park	March 1- Nov 30th	1x week	1	1	6 yard	6 yard	\$270.17	6Yd Trash	\$283.68	6Yd Trash	\$297.87	6Yd Trash	\$1,870.00	6Yd Trash	\$1,950.00	6Yd Trash	\$2,030.00	6Yd Trash	\$1,993.00	6Yd Trash	\$1,993.00	6Yd Trash	\$2,093.00	6Yd Trash		
52 White Rock Road Westerly, RI 02891	Dec. 1- Feb. 28th	1x month					\$155.20	6Yd recycle	\$162.96	6Yd recycle	\$171.11	6Yd recycle	\$1,170.00	6Yd recyc	\$1,220.00	6Yd recyc	\$1,270.00	6Yd recycle	\$702.00	6Yd recyc	\$702.00	6Yd recyc	\$737.00	6Yd recycle		
TRASH AND APPROPRIATE RECYCLING																										
Bradford Rec Facility	June 1- August 31	1x week	1		4 yard	we have recycle bins	\$230.31	4Yd Trash	\$242.46	4Yd Trash	\$254.29	4Yd Trash	\$750.00	4Yd Trash	\$800.00	4Yd Trash	\$850.00	4Yd Trash	\$530.00	4Yd Trash	\$530.00	4Yd Trash	\$557.00	4Yd Trash		
TOWN SUB-TOTAL							\$25,120.28		\$26,376.64		\$27,692.92		\$20,852.50		\$21,678.75		\$22,516.25		\$23,408.00		\$23,408.00		\$24,578.00			

High School- 23 Ward Ave.	Mon, Tues, Wed & Fri*	4	1		10 yard		\$1,045.00	10 Yd Trash	\$1,097.25	10 Yd Trash	\$1,152.12	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$14,761.00	10 Yd Trash	\$14,761.00	10 Yd Trash	\$15,499.00	10 Yd Trash
	Tues*	1		1	10 yard	10 yard	\$325.00	10 Yd recycle	\$341.25	10 Yd recycle	\$358.32	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$1,680.00	10 Yd recycle	\$1,680.00	10 Yd recycle	\$1,764.00	10 Yd recycle
Babcock Hall - 23 Highland Ave.	Mon, Tues, Wed & Fri*	4	1		10 yard		\$1,045.00	10 Yd Trash	\$1,097.25	10 Yd Trash	\$1,152.12	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$14,761.00	10 Yd Trash	\$14,761.00	10 Yd Trash	\$15,499.00	10 Yd Trash
	Tues*	1		1	10 yard	10 yard	\$325.00	10 Yd recycle	\$341.25	10 Yd recycle	\$358.32	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$1,680.00	10 Yd recycle	\$1,680.00	10 Yd recycle	\$1,764.00	10 Yd recycle
Middle School - 10 Sandy Hill Rd.	Mon thru Fri*	5	1		10 yard		\$1,300.00	10 Yd Trash	\$1,365.00	10 Yd Trash	\$1,433.25	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$	10 Yd Trash	\$18,202.00	10 Yd Trash	\$18,202.00	10 Yd Trash	\$19,112.00	10 Yd Trash
	Tues*	1		1	10 yard	10 yard	\$325.00	10 Yd recycle	\$341.25	10 Yd recycle	\$358.32	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$	10 Yd recycle	\$1,680.00	10 Yd recycle	\$1,680.00	10 Yd recycle	\$1,764.00	10 Yd recycle
State Street School - 35 State St.	Tues & Thurs*	2	1		6 Yard		\$367.00	6 Yd Trash	\$385.35	6 Yd Trash	\$404.62	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,965.00	6 Yd Trash
	Tues & Thurs*	2		1	6 yard	6 yard	\$290.00	6 Yd recycle	\$304.50	6 Yd recycle	\$319.73	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,814.00	6 Yd recycle
Dunn's Corner - 8 1/2 Plateau Rd.	Tues & Thurs*	2	1		6 Yard		\$367.00	6 Yd Trash	\$385.35	6 Yd Trash	\$404.62	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,965.00	6 Yd Trash
	Tues & Thurs*	2		1	6 yard	6 yard	\$290.00	6 Yd recycle	\$304.50	6 Yd recycle	\$319.73	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,814.00	6 Yd recycle
Elementary School - 39 Springbrook Rd.	Tues & Thurs*	2	1		6 Yard		\$367.00	6 Yd Trash	\$385.35	6 Yd Trash	\$404.62	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,965.00	6 Yd Trash
	Tues & Thurs*	2		1	6 yard	6 yard	\$290.00	6 Yd recycle	\$304.50	6 Yd recycle	\$319.73	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,814.00	6 Yd recycle
Bus Facility - 8 Springbrook Rd (Year Round)	Tues & Thurs	2	1		6 Yard		\$367.00	6 Yd Trash	\$385.35	6 Yd Trash	\$404.62	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,729.00	6 Yd Trash	\$4,965.00	6 Yd Trash
	Tues & Thurs	2		1	6 yard	6 yard	\$290.00	6 Yd recycle	\$304.50	6 Yd recycle	\$319.73	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,728.00	6 Yd recycle	\$1,814.00	6 Yd recycle
							\$6,993.00		\$7,342.65		\$7,709.85													
							SCHOOL SUB-TOTAL	\$69,930.00	\$73,426.50	\$77,098.50	#####	#####	\$77,098.00	\$78,592.00	\$78,592.00	\$82,518.00								
year only							TOWN & SCHOOL TOTAL	\$95,050.28	\$99,803.14	\$104,791.42	\$90,782.50	\$95,104.75	\$99,614.25	\$102,000.00	\$102,000.00	\$107,096.00								
Recycling containers must be clearly marked for single stream recycling.	Extra 6 Yd Pick-up						\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00
Recyclables may not be combined with trash in any truck unless vehicle has separate compartments and is clearly labeled for recycling.	Extra 10 Yd Pick-up						\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
Recyclables brought to the Westerly Transfer Station must be clean and free of contaminants.	Extra 12 Yd Pick-up						NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00
	Digital Copy							YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES						
	Signed Appendix A							YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES						
	Delivery/Start Date							5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS	5 DAYS						
	Exclusions							NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE						
	Acknowledge Addendum #1							NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO						
	EMR RATING							0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.86						
	Signed our Bid Form							YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES						