

Bid No. 2022-039		Cold Patch, Hot Patch, Asphalt Emulsion, and Concrete												6/14/2022	
Town of Westerly, RI 02891		Vendors												2:00 P.M.	
		Johnston Asphalt, LLC		Wescon Corp of CT		Arragansett Improvement Co		Ambra Construction Co, Inc		Rhode Island Ready Mix LLC		Richmond Sand and Stone LLC			
Item #	EST QTY	Unit	Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	100	TON	Cold Patch-Delivered	\$160.00	\$16,000.00	no bid		no bid		\$160.00	\$16,000.00	no bid		\$160.00	\$16,000.00
1	100	TON	Cold Patch-Picked-up	\$145.00	\$14,500.00	no bid		no bid		\$155.00	\$15,500.00	no bid		\$155.00	\$15,500.00
2	500	TON	Hot Patch-Picked-up	no bid		\$100.00	\$50,000.00	\$89.00	\$44,500.00	\$95.00	\$47,500.00	no bid		no bid	
3	20	GAL	Asphalt Emulsion-Delivered (5-gallon pail)	no bid		\$100.00	\$2,000.00	no bid		\$85.00	\$1,700.00	no bid		no bid	
3	20	GAL	Asphalt Emulsion-Picked-up (5-gallon pail)	no bid		\$100.00	\$2,000.00	\$70.00	\$1,400.00	\$75.00	\$1,500.00	no bid		no bid	
4	30	CY	Concrete-Delivered	no bid		\$135.00	\$4,050.00	no bid		no bid		\$150.00	\$4,500.00	no bid	
			Plant location for hot patch pick up	blank		Pawcatuck, CT		blank		Johnston, RI		blank		Richmond, RI	
			Delivery	as directed		1 day		N/A		1 day		1 day		1 day	
<b>Grand Total</b>					\$30,500.00		\$58,050.00		\$45,900.00		\$82,200.00		\$4,500.00		\$31,500.00
Bid Bond Submitted				N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	
Exclusions				None		None		None		None		None		None	
Experience Mod Rating Submitted				N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	
Addendum Submitted (if applicable)				N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	
Contractor's Experience Submitted				N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	
Subcontractor's List Submitted				N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	
Bidder Certification Submitted				Yes		Yes		<b>NO</b>		Yes		Yes		Yes	
Vendor Name				Johnston Asphalt, LLC		Wescon Corp of CT		Arragansett Improvement Co		Ambra Construction Co, Inc		Rhode Island Ready Mix LLC		Richmond Sand and Stone LLC	
Vendor Address				Wendell Ave, Johnston, RI 02891		Wmata Ave, Pawcatuck, CT 06257		Allens Ave, Providence, RI 02903		Centre of NE Blvd, Coventry, RI 02822		Stilson Rd, Richmond, RI 02884		Stilson Rd, Richmond, RI 02884	
Vendor Contract				Alan Chicoine		David C. Lynch Sr.		Jon. S. Toegemann		Michael E. Yaseen		Michael E. Yaseen		Michael E. Yaseen	
Telephone				(401)231-9550		(860) 599-2500		(401) 996-9473		(401) 737-1300		(401) 539-8222		(401) 539-7770	
Email Address				<a href="mailto:asphalt@asmg.com">asphalt@asmg.com</a>		<a href="mailto:sales@ihlynch.com">sales@ihlynch.com</a>		<a href="mailto:wepavenico@nicori.com">wepavenico@nicori.com</a>		<a href="mailto:mondsandandstone@gmail.com">mondsandandstone@gmail.com</a>		<a href="mailto:mondsandandstone@gmail.com">mondsandandstone@gmail.com</a>		<a href="mailto:mondsandandstone@gmail.com">mondsandandstone@gmail.com</a>	